
Bid Code Make Model Drive Drive Drive Drive

F1 Ford Bronco Sport 1.5L Eco boost 2.0L Eco boost 1.5L Eco boost 2.0L Eco boost
F1A Ford Bronco Sport $27,429 N/A No Bid No Bid
F2 Ford Edge 2.0 Eco Boost 2.7L Eco Boost 2.0 Eco Boost 2.7L Eco Boost

F2A Ford Edge $33,903.00 N/A No Bid No Bid
F2B Ford Edge $34,613.00 N/A No Bid No Bid
F3 Ford Escape 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost

F3A Ford Escape $23,724.00 N/A No Bid No Bid
F3B Ford Escape $25,499.00 N/A No Bid No Bid
F4 Ford Explorer 2.3L Eco Boost 3.0 L Eco Boost 2.3L Eco Boost 3.0 L Eco Boost

F4A Ford Explorer $34,391.00 N/A No Bid No Bid
F4B Ford Explorer $38,566.00 N/A No Bid No Bid
F5 Ford Expedition 3.5L Eco Boost N/A 3.5L Eco Boost N/A

F5A Ford Expedition $49,188.00 No Bid
F5B Ford Expedition $54,425 No Bid

Total $321,738.00 No Bid

Bid Tab
Ford 

SUV's
Anderson Ford Gregg Young

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for 
additional Manufacturer Models not listed 

above or that may have not been released at the 
time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE 
OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

5% No bid



Bid 
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine

F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6
F7A Ford Transit $43,352 N/A No Bid No Bid
F7B Ford Transit $46,037 $48,182 No Bid No Bid
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6

F7C Ford Transit $43,352 N/A No Bid No Bid
F7D Ford Transit $46,895 $48,040 No Bid No Bid
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6

F7F Ford Transit $44,484 N/A No Bid No Bid
F7G Ford Transit $48,018 $49,587 No Bid No Bid
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6

F7H Ford Transit $49,383 $50,485 No Bid No Bid
F7I Ford Transit $53,169 $55,314 No Bid No Bid
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6
F7J Ford Transit $50,673 $52,818 No Bid No Bid
F7K Ford Transit $54,459 $55,687 No Bid No Bid

Bid Tab
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Total: $839,935 No Bid

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount 
for additional Manufacturer Models not 
listed above or that may have not been 

released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE 
OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

5% No Bid



Bid 
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

F9 Ford Mavrick 2.0L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco Boost
F9A Ford Mavrick $26,054 No Bid No Bid
F9B Ford Mavrick $25,854 No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford Ranger 2.3L EcoBoost 2.7L Eco Boost 3.0 Eco Boost 2.3L EcoBoost 2.7L Eco Boost 3.0 Eco Boost

F10A Ford Ranger $29,418 n/a n/a No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10B Ford Ranger $34,283 $38,575 n/a No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10A Ford F150 N/A N/A $33,145 n/a No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10B Ford F150 N/A N/A $39,355.00 $ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10C Ford F150 N/A n/a $33,345 $33,487 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10D Ford F150 N/A $38,122 $39,553.00 $39,553.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10E Ford F150 N/A $35,087 $36,471 $36,477 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10F Ford F150 N/A $39,931 $41,362.00 $41,362.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10G Ford F150 N/A n/a n/a n/a No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10H Ford F150 N/A n/a n/a n/a No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost
F10I Ford F150 N/A $36,181 $37,580 $37,583 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10J Ford F150 N/A $40,999 $42,557.00 $42,557.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10K Ford F150 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F10L Ford F150 N/A N/A $43,027.00 $43,027.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Gregg YoungAnderson Ford
Bid Tab

Ford
Light Duty Trucks

Total $931,458.00 No Bid

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount 
for additional Manufacturer Models not listed 
above or that may have not been released at 

the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE 
OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

5% No Bid



Bid Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel
F11A Ford F250 $39,280 N/A $49,597 $51,287 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11B Ford F250 $43,052 N/A $52,116 $53,784 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F11C Ford F250 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11D Ford F250 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F11E Ford F250 $41,384 N/A $51,718 $53,587 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11F Ford F250 $45,349 N/A $54,413 $56,119 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F11G Ford F250 $42,587 N/A $51,587 $54,743 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11H Ford F250 $46,481 N/A $55,545 $57,204 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel
F11I Ford F250 $44,135 N/A $53,199 $54,986 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F11J Ford F250 $46,670 N/A $55,734 $57,415 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12A Ford F350 $41,702 N/A $49,387 $52,410 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12B Ford F350 $44,229 N/A $53,293 $55,007 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12E Ford F350 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12F Ford F350 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12G Ford F350 $42,587 N/A $53,059 $54,723 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12H Ford F350 $46,512 N/A $55,576 $57,269 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12K Ford F350 $43,687 N/A $54,195 $55,919 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12L Ford F350 $47,663 N/A $56,727 $58,417 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12M Ford F350 $45,312 N/A $54,376 $56,098 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F12N Ford F350 $47,839 N/A $56,903 $58,677 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total: $2,453,539 No Bid

Gregg Young
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Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for 
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above 
or that may have not been released at the time of 

this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF 

OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
5% No Bid



Bid Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

FP1 Ford Police Interceptor Utility 3.3L HEV AWD 3.3L  V6 FFV AWD 3.0L EcoBoost® AWD 3.3L HEV AWD 3.3L  V6 FFV AWD 3.0L EcoBoost® AWD
FP1A Ford Police Interceptor Utility $44,673 $42,587 $45,514 $ $45,270 N/A
FP2 Ford F150 Police Responder 3.5L EcoBoost® V6 3.5L EcoBoost® V6

FP2A Ford F150 Police Responder N/A No Bid
FP2A Ford F150 Police Responder $44,581 No Bid
FP3 Ford F150 SSV 3.5L Power Boostv6 Hybrid 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.0L V8 3.5L Power Boostv6 Hybrid 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.0L V8

FP3A Ford F150 SSV N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
FP3B Ford F150 SSV N/A $41,987 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
FP4 Ford Expedition /MAX SSV 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L Eco Boost V6

FP4A Ford Expedition SSV $42,861 No Bid
FP4B Ford Expedition SSV $47,598 No Bid
FP4C Ford Expedition Max SSV $45,476 No Bid
FP4D Ford Expedition Max SSV $50,213 No Bid
FP5 Ford Transit Prisoner Transport 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L V6

FP5A Ford Transit Prisoner Transport $53,556 $51,411 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Notes: This bid had the majority of bid pricing for vehicles avialible on this section of the solicitation Only one vehicle in this section recived bid pricing

Total: $42,587 $45,270
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Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may have 
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